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1. Abstract
COVID-19 due by the new SARS-CoV-2 coronavirus, is respon-
sible for the current pandemic. If respiratory symptoms are in the 
foreground and condition the prognosis of the disease, the gastro-
intestinal symptoms initially described as rare are reported more 
and more frequently in the latest studies.

Those studies suggest that they are a sign of a favorable environ-
ment for an aggravation of the disease, probably in connection 
with the development of inflammation. Inevitably, the influence of 
the gut microbiota is suspected.

The aim of our work and is to report the digestive manifestations 
during a covid-19 infection through a series of cases.

2. Introduction
Covid-19 infection is often accompanied by digestive problems, 
which can precede the onset of respiratory symptoms. The latter 
suggest that they are the sign of a favorable ground for a worsening 
of the disease, probably linked to the development of inflamma-
tion. Inevitably, the influence of the gut microbiota is suspected.

We report, through a series of cases, the digestive manifestations 
during infection by covid-19

3. Materials and Methods
This was a single-center descriptive prospective study that took 
place over a period of 5 weeks from May 3, 2020 to June 9, 2020 in 
a field hospital located in the city of Fez in Morocco. We included 
in our study all patients presenting general and / or digestive symp-
toms and in whom the PCR test for SARS-CoV2 was positive. The 
agreement of the ethics committee was not necessary given the 
observational nature of the study. Patients were registered as they 
were admitted to the hospital.

All our patients have undergone a careful clinical examination, 
and laboratory examinations. All the data were collected using an 
operating sheet showing the epidemiological, clinical, biological, 
electrical and pulmonary imaging parameters as well as serologi-
cal monitoring with twice-daily monitoring of clinical parameters.

All of the data was entered on an Excel table, then analyzed by this 
same software.

4. Results
We recruited 98 patients with general and / or digestive symptoms 
with a positive RT-PCR test for SARS-COV2.

All of our patients were male. The average age was 35.68 years 
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with extremes ranging from 24 years to 54 years. No history of 
chronic inflammatory bowel disease or other digestive pathologies 
has been reported. Unbalanced diabetes with a fasting blood sugar 
of 4g/dl was found in one patient. Among the patients, there was 
a case of history of pulmonary tuberculosis with the notion of he-
moptysis and a patient followed for a depressive syndrome stable 
under treatment.

The reason for consultation was represented by: fever at 38° C in 
23 patients or 23.46%, asthenia in 8 patients or 8.16%, pharynge-
al pain in 6 patients or 6.12%, diarrhea in 41 patients in 41.83% 
of cases. We also noted anosmia and ageusia in 26 patients, i.e. 
26.53%, anorexia in 2 patients and 9 patients were asymptomatic, 
i.e. 9.18% (Figure 1)

Figure 1: Symptoms and reason for consultation

Paraclinical explorations were normal apart from a CT scan which 
showed bronchial dilation in a patient who had hemoptysis. All 
our patients were put on Hydroxychloroquine in combination with 
Azithromycin in addition to vitamin C, vitamin D and enoxaparin.

A control PCR was negative on D6 of treatment in 25 patients, ie 
25.51% of cases.

5. Discussion
SARS-CoV-2 is responsible for a polymorphous digestive symp-
tomatology that may precede the onset of respiratory symptoms. 
Several studies have recently converged to describe the presence 
of digestive signs in SARS-CoV-2 infection. In the cohort of 552 
Chinese hospitals comprising 1,099 patients, the authors observed 
nausea or vomiting in 5% of cases and diarrhea in 3.8% of cases 
[1]. More recent cohorts suggest that diarrhea can be observed in 
2 to 10% of cases, or even up to 39% in a cohort of 140 patients, 
while nausea or vomiting was reported in 1 to 17% of cases [2, 3]. 
In our series, no patient presented with nausea or vomiting. Chi-
nese researchers recently analyzed digestive symptoms in patients 
with Covid-19 admitted to three hospitals in Hubei province. It 
turns out that Covid-19 patients may present with diarrhea as the 
first symptom of the disease. In rare cases [4], a patient can even 
present digestive symptoms in the absence of respiratory symp-
toms and this is the case for our patients.

 Diarrhea is generally scanty and short-lived, not exceeding 3-4 
stools per day, which is in agreement with our study, with a fre-
quency varying from 2 to 39% [2]

A Chinese retrospective series of 1,141 confirmed cases of 
COVID-19, 16% of patients had isolated digestive symptoms [4], 
it was diarrhea in 37% of cases and abdominal pain in 25% of 

cases. In another study of 204 patients, 51% had digestive impair-
ment including diarrhea in 34% of cases [5]. Patients with diges-
tive symptoms had a longer hospital stay compared to those with-
out digestive symptoms. The authors also observed a correlation 
between the severity of respiratory involvement and the intensity 
of digestive symptoms. These elements are confirmed by a study 
of 651 patients, of whom 11.4% had at least one digestive symp-
tom. Patients with digestive symptoms had more severe disease (p 
<0.001) [6].

There is a correlation between the severity of respiratory involve-
ment and the intensity of digestive symptoms

 Anorexia seems frequent and it was noted in 40 to 50% of cases 
[2, 3] and digestive bleeding was reported in 4 to 13.7% of cases 
[2, 3].  In our study, only 2 patients had anorexia.

For patients with diarrhea, they are admitted to the intensive care 
unit (ICU) less than patients with respiratory distress syndrome: 
[7] in our series for patients with diarrhea, no case has been re-
ferred to the intensive care unit.

Another study involving 200 patients [8] found   that many pa-
tients had digestive symptoms as the main complaint, confirming 
that digestive symptoms, such as diarrhea, may be a clinical fea-
ture of COVID-19 presentation, and that the index of suspicion 
may need to be increased earlier in these cases rather than waiting 
for respiratory symptoms to appear.

It is important to take these digestive disorders into account in pa-
tients treated with hydroxy chloroquine, whether or not associated 
with azithromycin. In our series, 66 patients had diarrhea second-
ary to hydroxychloroquine, i.e. 67.34%, which was easily resolved 
by taking probiotics.
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The frequency of digestive manifestations during SARS COV in-
fection could be explained by the fact that SARS-CoV-2 shares 
80% of the genomic sequences of the SARS coronavirus (SARS-
COV). Both viruses have an affinity for angiotensin-converting 
enzyme 2 (ACE2) receptors in human cells. The virus seems to 
use them to attach to and enter the cell. The ACE2 receptor is pres-
ent in the alveolar cells but also in the digestive tract. Indeed, it is 
observed at the level of the upper part of the esophagus, but also 
at the level of the enterocytes of the ileum and of the colonocytes. 
In addition, SARS-COV has also been identified at the hepatic and 
pancreatic level [9].

SARS-CoV-2 can also damage, directly or indirectly, the digestive 
system through the body's inflammatory response. Several studies 
have also shown the presence of the virus' genetic material in the 
stool (up to 53% of patients analyzed). [2, 3].

Another systematic review and meta-analysis of 60 studies involv-
ing 4,243 patients showed that the median fecal viral load was 
higher in patients with diarrhea than in patients without diarrhea 
(5.1 log copies / ml vs. 3.9 log copies / ml; P = 0.06) [10]. The 
same authors showed that RNA from the virus was detected in 
stool samples from 48% of patients, concluding that stool sam-
ples are highly contagious in patients with COVID-19 even after 
recovery.

Finally, it is possible that the presence of the coronavirus disrupts 
the intestinal microbiota. Studies to analyze the impact of SARS-
CoV-2 on the intestinal bacterial flora are underway.

Liver test abnormalities have also been described in COVID-19 
patients. The frequency of cytolysis varies according to the series 
between 14.8 to 53.1%; the elevation of transaminases remaining 
moderate in the majority of cases [2, 11]. In a series of 56 patients, 
gamma-glutamyl transferase (GGT) was elevated in 54% of cases. 
Abnormalities in liver function tests are usually mild and transient. 
They seem more intense in severe COVID-19. Thus, in a cohort of 
99 patients included in Wuhan, 43 had hepatic cytolysis including 
one patient who had severe respiratory impairment and an eleva-
tion of ALT to 7,590 U / L. It was not specified whether it was 
hypoxic hepatitis or an attack directly related to COVID-19.

The abnormalities of the hepatic tests are probably multiple caus-
es, being able to be the consequence of a direct attack of the virus 
- the SARS-COV being able to bind to the cholangiocyteand the 
hepatocytes via the ACE2 receptor of lesions of dysimmunitary 
origin, of drug-induced hepatitis or hypoxic hepatitis in the most 
severe patients.

For pancreatic manifestations, a study was conducted in 52 pa-
tients with confirmed SARS-CoV-2 infection in a Chinese hospital 
over a 5-week period by monitoring the level of pancreatic en-
zymes. An increase in amylase (> 90 U / L) or lipase (> 70 U / 
L) was observed in 9 (17%) patients [9]. >> No information was 
available regarding possible CT abnormalities. It should be noted 

that patients with elevated pancreatic enzymes had more severe 
respiratory disease.

In our series, no case of hepatic or pancreatic damage was men-
tioned.

6. Conclusion
In this endemic context, the diagnosis of COVID-19 should be 
considered for patients with gastrointestinal symptoms. This will 
help prevent the transmission of the virus in the hospital environ-
ment, in particular to health professionals and not delay the man-
agement of patients with gastrointestinal manifestations. Diarrhea 
is the main gastrointestinal symptom and appears to be present in 
half of patients with COVID-19. These data must be disseminat-
ed in the medical community and must be confirmed by further 
studies.
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